

**SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
 BID TABULATION
 Bid 16-68**

AUDIO AND VIDEO EQUIPMENT FOR NEW HAMPSTEAD HIGH SCHOOL

CLOSING DATE & TIME: March 29, 2016 @ 11:00 A.M.

Note: 0 addendum issued against this project.

Item #	Qty	Description	Stage Front Presentation Systems 6 Southern Oaks Dr. Savannah, GA 31405 Phone: 912-236-1345 Fax: 912-721-5730		W.B. Hunt Co., Inc. 100 Main St. Melrose, MA 02176 Phone: 781-462-2343 Fax: 603-606-4074		B & H Foto & Electronic Corp. 420 Ninth Ave New York, NY 10001 Phone: 212-239-7503 Fax: 212-239-7509		Camcor, Inc. 2273 S Church St. Burlington, NC 27215 Phone: 800-868-2462 Fax: 800-298-1181	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1.	2	GoPro HERO4 Silver MFR # CHDHY-401	404.67	809.34	308.00	616.00	328.34	656.68		
2.	1	Blackmagic Design Cinema Camera (MFT Mount) MFR# CINECAM26KMFT	2,256.42	2,256.42	1,699.00	1,699.00	1,674.00	1,674.00	1,742.75	1,742.75
3.	2	Canon EOS Rebel T5i DSLR Camera with 18-135mm Lens MFR # 8595B005	1,140.87	2,281.74	752.00	1,504.00	739.90	1,479.80	940.95	1,881.90
4.	2	Manfrotto MVH500AH Fluid Head & 755XB Tripod with Carrying Bag MFR # MVH500AH,755XBK	470.38	940.76	352.00	704.00	355.26	710.52	143.90	287.80
5.	2	Rode VideoMic Pro Compact Directional On-Camera Microphone MFR # VIDEOMIC PRO	399.75	799.50	164.00	328.00	135.00	270.00	217.85	435.70
6.	2	Rode VideoMic GO Lightweight On-Camera Microphone MFR # VIDEOMIC-GO	121.77	243.54	66.00	132.00	74.95	149.90	104.41	208.82
7.	2	Steadicam Merlin 2 Camera Stabilizing System MFR # MERLIN-2	529.12	1,058.24	Discontinued		259.00	518.00	690.68	1,381.36
8.	1	G-Technology 2TB G-DRIVE G1 USB 3.0 Hard Drive with Gobbler Software MFR # OG04013	196.73	196.73	No Bid		133.20	133.20		
9.	2	Blue Yeti USB Microphone (Silver) MFR # 1950	121.77	243.54	118.00	236.00	108.40	216.80	124.70	249.40
10.	1	Avid Pro Tools 11 - Professional Audio Recording and Music Creation Software (Boxed with DVDs) MFR # 9900-65450-00	736.77	736.77	No Bid		448.00	448.00		
11.	1	E-Image ES-120 48" Carbon Fiber Slider MFR # ES-120	555.87	555.87	492.00	492.00	439.95	439.95		

Item #	Qty	Description	Stage Front Presentation Systems		W.B. Hunt Co., Inc.		B & H Foto & Electronic Corp.		Camcor, Inc.	
12.	1	VariZoom Solo Jib (Aluminum) MFR # SOLOJIB-AL	307.43	307.43	309.00	309.00	279.95	279.95		
13.	1	DJI Phantom 3 Advanced Quadcopter with 1080p Camera and 3-Axis Gimbal MFR # CP.PT.000160	885.60	885.60	728.00	728.00	693.75	693.75	760.92	760.92
14.	1	Audio-Technica BPHS1 Broadcast Stereo Headset MFR # BPHS1	154.42	154.42	162.00	162.00	129.95	129.95	162.82	162.82
15.	1	Behringer PMP4000 16-Channel Powered Mixer MFR # PMP4000	430.50	430.50	No Bid		388.50	388.50	394.45	394.45
16.	1	DJI Phantom 3 Advanced with 1080p Camera and Battery Bundle with Backpack MFR # DJIP3AW2BP	1,658.77	1,658.77	1,163.00	1,163.00	1,149.95	1,149.95	1,188.92	1,188.92
17.	1	VIZIO E-Series E70-C3 70"-Class Full-Array Full HD Smart LED TV MFR # E70-C3	1,531.35	1,531.35	No Bid		1,340.00	1,340.00	1,309.94	1,309.94
18.	1	VIZIO SB4051-C0 40" 5.1-Channel Soundbar Speaker System MFR # SB4051-C0	356.70	356.70	No Bid		342.00	342.00	292.93	292.93
19.	3	Microsoft 12.3" Surface Pro 4 128GB Multi-Touch Tablet (Silver) MFR # SU3-00001	983.98	2,951.94	No Bid		872.00	2,616.00		
20.	1	Impact Background Support System - 12' Wide MRF # 3046	122.98	122.98	89.00	89.00	78.71	78.71		
21.	1	Impact Super Collapsible Background - 8 x 16' (Chroma Green) MFR # BGSC-CG-816	135.23	135.23	No Bid		82.46	82.46		
22.	1	Westcott 9 x 20' Wrinkle-Resistant Cotton Background (ChromaKey Green) MFR # 132	159.77	159.77	114.00	114.00	96.05	96.05		
23.	1	Digital Juice ChromaPop Studio (12 x 18') MFR # CHROMA.POP.12X18.WC	437.81	437.81	No Bid		316.31	316.31		
24.	1	Lastolite Panoramic Background (13', Chromakey Green) MFR # LL LB7622	621.13	621.13	421.00	421.00	420.41	420.41		
25.	1	Dracast LED1000 Plus Series Bi-Color LED Light MFR # # DRPL-LED1000-BV/G	1,379.13	1,379.13	1,199.00	1,199.00	1,161.62	1,161.62		
26.	2	Dracast LED500 Pro Bi-Color LED Light with V-Mount Battery Plate MFR # DR-LED500-BV	733.38	1,466.76	719.00	1,438.00	695.42	1,390.84		

Item #	Qty	Description	Stage Front Presentation Systems		W.B. Hunt Co., Inc.		B & H Foto & Electronic Corp.		Camcor, Inc.	
27.	2	Novation Launchpad Pro MFR # LAUNCHPAD-PRO	319.78	639.56	No Bid		224.00	448.00		
28.	6	Sennheiser Momentum 2 Bluetooth Over-Ear Wireless Headphone with Integrated Microphone (Ivory) MFR # 506381	491.93	2,951.58	No Bid		325.00	1,950.00		
29.	1	Sennheiser HD 600 Circumaural Open-Back Professional Monitor Headphone MFR # HD600	335.79	335.79	293.00	293.00	295.00	295.00	297.76	297.76
30.	2	Sennheiser AVX Camera-Mountable Lavalier Pro Digital Wireless Set (MKE2 Lavalier) MFR # AVX-MKE2 SET-4-US	995.74	1,991.48	891.00	1,782.00	764.00	1,528.00	896.90	1,793.80
31.	2	DPA Microphones d:fine 4088 In-Ear Broadcast Headset Mic, 2-Ear Mount, 2-In-Ear with MicroDot to LEMO Connector (Black) MFR # FID88BA03-2-IE2-B	1,254.53	2,509.06	No Bid		847.95	1,695.90		
32.	1	HP Designjet Z5400 44" PostScript ePrinter MFR # E1L21A#B1K	6,888.00	6,888.00	5,495.00	5,495.00	5,822.70	5,822.70	5,589.74	5,589.74
33.	4	VIZIO E-Series E48-C2 48"-Class Full-Array Full HD Smart LED TV MFR # E48-C2	491.97	1,967.88	No Bid		398.00	1,592.00		
34.	5	Peerless-AV SmartMount Articulating Wall Mount for 37 to 71" Displays (Black) MFR # SA771PU	371.87	1,859.35	388.00	1,940.00	290.00	1,450.00	320.71	1,603.55
35.	1	InFocus JTouch 65" Interactive Whiteboard with LightCast (Wireless) MFR # INF6501CP	3,522.72	3,522.72	2,995.00	2,995.00	3,135.05	3,135.05	2,537.98	2,537.98
Bid Total:			\$45,387.39		\$23,839.00		\$35,100.00		\$22,120.54	
Document Signed: Y / N			Y		Y		Y		Y	
L/MWBE Status			Local		Not stated		Non-Local		Not stated	
Documents submitted			Original, 1 copy		Original, 1 copy		Original		Original, 1 copy	
# of Days Delivery can be made After Receipt of Purchase Order			21-42		14		7-14		3-30	

Item #	Qty	Description	Tri State Camera 150 Sullivan St. Brooklyn, NY 11231 Phone: 212-633-2290 Fax: 212-633-2392		California Media Solutions 536 Stone Rd, # B Benicia, CA 94510 Phone: 707-746-8273 Fax: 707-746-7580		Unified AV Systems Inc. 120 Interstate North Pkwy, Suite 314 Atlanta, GA 30339 Phone: 770-955-7368 Fax: 770-955-9246		Summit Systems Inc. 463 Pooler Pkwy, #334 Pooler, GA 31322 Phone: 678-482-8010 Fax: 678-482-8060	
1.	2	GoPro HERO4 Silver MFR # CHDHY-401	359.00	718.00	348.00	696.00	400.00	800.00	411.25	822.50
2.	1	Blackmagic Design Cinema Camera (MFT Mount) MFR# CINECAM26KMFT	1,796.00	1,796.00	1,759.00	1,759.00	1,942.96	1,942.96	2,493.75	2,493.75
3.	2	Canon EOS Rebel T5i DSLR Camera with 18- 135mm Lens MFR # 8595B005	699.00	1,398.00	765.00	1,530.00	869.55	1,739.10	1,171.42	2,342.84
4.	2	Manfrotto MVH500AH Fluid Head & 755XB Tripod with Carrying Bag MFR # MVH500AH,755XBK	395.00	790.00	375.00	750.00	429.21	858.42	562.35	1,124.70
5.	2	Rode VideoMic Pro Compact Directional On- Camera Microphone MFR # VIDEOMIC PRO	210.00	420.00	165.00	330.00	202.45	404.90	237.49	474.98
6.	2	Rode VideoMic GO Lightweight On-Camera Microphone MFR # VIDEOMIC-GO	88.00	176.00	72.00	144.00	81.52	163.04	106.24	212.48
7.	2	Steadicam Merlin 2 Camera Stabilizing System MFR # MERLIN-2	479.00	958.00	349.00	698.00	281.52	563.04	312.49	624.98
8.	1	G-Technology 2TB G-DRIVE G1 USB 3.0 Hard Drive with Gobbler Software MFR # 0G04013	168.00	168.00	161.00	161.00	177.72	177.72	199.94	199.94
9.	2	Blue Yeti USB Microphone (Silver) MFR # 1950	114.50	229.00	115.00	230.00	128.44	256.88	136.18	272.36
10.	1	Avid Pro Tools 11 - Professional Audio Recording and Music Creation Software (Boxed with DVDs) MFR # 9900-65450-00	504.00	504.00	589.00	589.00	325.00	325.00	748.75	748.75
11.	1	E-Image ES-120 48" Carbon Fiber Slider MFR # ES-120	607.50	607.50	472.00	472.00	646.74	646.74	743.75	743.75
12.	1	VariZoom Solo Jib (Aluminum) MFR # SOLOJIB-AL	365.00	365.00	245.00	245.00	333.20	333.20	436.19	436.19

Item #	Qty	Description	Tri State Camera		California Media Solutions		Unified AV Systems Inc.		Summit Systems Inc.	
13.	1	DJI Phantom 3 Advanced Quadcopter with 1080p Camera and 3-Axis Gimbal MFR # CP.PT.000160	699.00	699.00	735.00	735.00	831.47	831.47	998.75	998.75
14.	1	Audio-Technica BPHS1 Broadcast Stereo Headset MFR # BPHS1	179.00	179.00	148.00	148.00	159.73	159.73	248.75	248.75
15.	1	Behringer PMP4000 16-Channel Powered Mixer MFR # PMP4000	480.00	480.00	388.00	388.00	475.54	475.54	624.99	624.99
16.	1	DJI Phantom 3 Advanced with 1080p Camera and Battery Bundle with Backpack MFR # DJIP3AW2BP	1,049.00	1,049.00	1,055.00	1,055.00	1,303.26	1,303.26	1,498.75	1,498.75
17.	1	VIZIO E-Series E70-C3 70"-Class Full-Array Full HD Smart LED TV MFR # E70-C3	1,500.00	1,500.00	1,305.00	1,305.00	1,547.79	1,546.79	1,560.00	1,560.00
18.	1	VIZIO SB4051-C0 40" 5.1-Channel Soundbar Speaker System MFR # SB4051-C0	365.00	365.00	385.00	385.00	380.42	380.42	435.00	435.00
19.	3	Microsoft 12.3" Surface Pro 4 128GB Multi-Touch Tablet (Silver) MFR # SU3-00001	950.00	2,850.00	900.00	2,700.00	977.12	2,931.36	1,123.75	3,371.25
20.	1	Impact Background Support System - 12' Wide MRF # 3046	118.00	118.00	100.00	100.00	116.61	116.61	124.99	124.99
21.	1	Impact Super Collapsible Background - 8 x 16' (Chroma Green) MFR # BGSC-CG-816	125.00	125.00	110.00	110.00	114.33	114.33	137.44	137.44
22.	1	Westcott 9 x 20' Wrinkle-Resistant Cotton Background (ChromaKey Green) MFR # 132	145.00	145.00	124.00	124.00	144.33	144.33	162.38	162.38
23.	1	Digital Juice ChromaPop Studio (12 x 18') MFR # CHROMA.POP.12X18.WC	389.00	389.00	325.00	325.00	386.90	386.90	444.94	444.94
24.	1	Lastolite Panoramic Background (13', Chromakey Green) MFR # LL LB7622	539.00	539.00	465.00	465.00	548.78	548.78	631.24	631.24
25.	1	Dracast LED1000 Plus Series Bi-Color LED Light MFR # # DRPL-LED1000-BV/G	1,006.00	1,006.00	1,298.00	1,298.00	1,410.50	1,410.50	1,622.08	1,622.08
26.	2	Dracast LED500 Pro Bi-Color LED Light with V-Mount Battery Plate MFR # DR-LED500-BV	626.00	1,252.00	705.00	1,410.00	650.03	1,300.06	749.94	1,499.88

Item #	Qty	Description	Tri State Camera		California Media Solutions		Unified AV Systems Inc.		Summit Systems Inc.	
27.	2	Novation Launchpad Pro MFR # LAUNCHPAD-PRO	315.00	630.00	240.00	480.00	276.75	553.50	324.99	649.98
28.	6	Sennheiser Momentum 2 Bluetooth Over-Ear Wireless Headphone with Integrated Microphone (Ivory) MFR # 506381	425.00	2,550.00	379.00	2,274.00	380.25	2,281.50	624.94	3,749.64
29.	1	Sennheiser HD 600 Circumaural Open-Back Professional Monitor Headphone MFR # HD600	347.00	347.00	296.00	296.00	296.74	296.74	499.94	499.94
30.	2	Sennheiser AVX Camera-Mountable Lavalier Pro Digital Wireless Set (MKE2 Lavalier) MFR # AVX-MKE2 SET-4-US	1,020.00	2,040.00	913.00	1,826.00	913.04	1,826.08	1,312.44	2,624.88
31.	2	DPA Microphones d:fine 4088 In-Ear Broadcast Headset Mic, 2-Ear Mount, 2-In-Ear with MicroDot to LEMO Connector (Black) MFR # FID88BA03-2-IE2-B	1,049.00	2,098.00	1,020.00	2,040.00	1,056.52	2,113.04	1,274.94	2,549.88
32.	1	HP Designjet Z5400 44" PostScript ePrinter MFR # E1L21A#B1K	5,990.00	5,990.00	5,654.00	5,654.00	6,516.30	6,516.30	7,493.75	7,493.75
33.	4	VIZIO E-Series E48-C2 48"-Class Full-Array Full HD Smart LED TV MFR # E48-C2	540.00	2,160.00	530.00	2,120.00	326.08	1,304.32	497.50	1,990.00
34.	5	Peerless-AV SmartMount Articulating Wall Mount for 37 to 71" Displays (Black) MFR # SA771PU	329.00	1,645.00	345.00	1,725.00	337.36	1,686.80	377.49	1,887.45
35.	1	InFocus JTouch 65" Interactive Whiteboard with LightCast (Wireless) MFR # INF6501CP	3,850.00	3,850.00	2,885.00	2,885.00	2,926.14	2,926.14	3,381.25	3,381.25
Bid Total:			\$40,135.50		\$37,452.00		\$39,365.50		\$48,684.43	
Document Signed: Y / N			Y		Y		Y		Y	
L/MWBE Status			Woman, Non-Local		Woman		Not stated		Local	
Documents submitted			Original, 1 copy		Original, 1 copy		Original		Original, 1 copy	
# of Days Delivery can be made After Receipt of Purchase Order			7-10		10 Business days		Not stated		30	

Item #	Qty	Description	School Specialty W6316 Design Dr Greenville, WI 54942 **No Bid**	PC University Distributors Inc. 99 West Hawthorne Avenue, Suite 521 Valley Stream, NY 11580 **No Bid**	Ingram Library Services One Ingram Blvd La Vergne, TN 37089 **No Bid**	Ken-A-Vision Mfg. Co., Inc. 5615 Raytown Rd Kansas City, MO 64133 **No Bid**
--------	-----	-------------	---	--	--	---

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Kathleen Watson-Scott, CPPB, Purchasing Agent KW Scott CERTIFIED BY: Paige Kriewall, Purchasing Agent PK

NUMBER OF BIDS ISSUED: 25 TO LMWBE: _____ A _____ W _____ H _____ M _____ L _____ N _____
NUMBER OF BIDS FROM LMWBE: _____ A _____ W 2 H _____ M _____ L 2 N 2
RECEIVED: 8 _____

KEY TO MINORITY DEISGNATIONS: A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W= WOMAN, H= HISPANIC, M=MAJORITY, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL