

SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION

Bid #20-50 -UNAUDITED

Environmental Cleanup (Annual Contract)

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: July 7, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

PRE-BID ATTENDANCE: N/A

Note: Two (2) addendums issued on this project.

BIDDERS:	AfterDisaster 2606 Phoenix Drive Bldg. 7 Greensboro, NC 27406 Telephone: 800-948-0242 Fax: 336-855-1144	Belfor USA Group, Inc. 185 Oakland Avenue Suite 150 Birmingham, MI 48009 Telephone: 248-594-1144 Fax: 248-594-0464	ServiceMaster Recovery Management 8301 Fortson Road Fortson, Georgia 31808 Telephone: 404-989-4779 Fax: None	American Property Restoration, Inc. 3440 Oakcliff Road Suite 124 Atlanta, Georgia 30340 Telephone: 770-733-3584 Fax: 678-387-2075	Harvin Holdings, LLC d/b/a SERVPRO of Savannah 4131 Ogeechee Road Suite 104 Savannah, Georgia 31405 Telephone: 912-234-9690 Fax: 912-234-13	Land and Cattle, LLC No Bid
Docs Signed:	Yes	Yes		Yes	Yes	
Min. Status:	Woman-Owned	Non-Local		African American	Local	
Addendum Ack:		Y 1,2		Y 1,2	Y 1,2	
LABOR RATES PER HOUR: FIRE/SMOKE; WATER/FLOOD; DISASTER RECOVERY						
1. Project Coordinator	\$94.00/Hour \$141.00/Overtime	\$162.00/Per Hour \$243.00/Overtime	\$125.00/Per Hour \$187.50/Overtime	\$105.00/Per Hour \$157.50/Overtime	\$130.00/Hour \$195.00/Overtime	
2. Superintendent	\$85.00/Hour \$127.50/Overtime	\$73.00/Hour \$109.50/Overtime	\$75.00/Per Hour \$112.50/Overtime	\$63.00/Per Hour \$94.50/Overtime	\$95.00/Hour \$142.50/Overtime	
3. Health and Safety	\$59.24/Hour \$88.86/Overtime	\$92.00/Per Hour \$138.00/Overtime	\$85.00/Per Hour \$127.50/Overtime	\$70.00/Per Hour \$105.00/Overtime	\$90.00/Hour \$135.00/Overtime	
4. Job Cost Administrator	\$43.45/Hour \$65.18/Overtime	\$40.00/Hour \$60.00/Overtime	\$90.00/Per Hour \$135.00/Overtime	\$34.00/Per Hour \$51.00/Overtime	\$40.00/Hour \$60.00/Overtime	
5. Production Technician	\$39.50/Hour \$59.25/Overtime	\$54.00/Hour \$81.00/Overtime	\$45.00/Per Hour \$67.50/Overtime	\$50.38/Per Hour \$75.57/Overtime	\$50.00/Hour \$75.00/Overtime	
6. General Labor	\$27.65/Hour \$41.48/Overtime	\$36.00/Hour \$54.00/Overtime	\$32.50/Per Hour \$48.75/Overtime	\$26.95/Per Hour \$40.42/Overtime	\$32.50/Hour \$48.75/Overtime	
LABOR RATES PER HOUR: CRIME SCENE; VANDALISM; MOLD RESTORATION						
7. Project Coordinator	\$117.50/Hour \$176.25/Overtime	\$162.00/Hour \$243.00/Overtime	\$125.00/Per Hour \$187.50/Overtime	\$108.00/Per Hour \$162.00/Overtime	\$130.00/Hour \$195.00/Overtime	
8. Superintendent	\$106.25/Hour \$159.38/Overtime	\$108.00/Hour \$162.00/Overtime	\$75.00/Per Hour \$112.50/Overtime	\$65.00/Per Hour \$97.50/Overtime	\$95.00/Hour \$142.50/Overtime	
9. Health and Safety	\$74.05/Hour \$111.08/Overtime	\$92.00/Hour \$138.00/Overtime	\$85.00/Per Hour \$127.50/Overtime	\$76.00/Per Hour \$114.00/Overtime	\$90.00/Hour \$135.00/Overtime	
10. Job Cost Administrator	\$54.32/Hour \$81.48/Overtime	\$40.00/Hour \$60.00/Overtime	\$90.00/Per Hour \$135.00/Overtime	\$34.00/Per Hour \$51.00/Overtime	\$40.00/Hour \$60.00/Overtime	
11. Production Technician	\$49.38/Hour \$74.07/Overtime	\$70.00/Hour \$105.00/Overtime	\$45.00/Per Hour \$67.50/Overtime	\$54.00/Per Hour \$81.00/Overtime	\$50.00/Hour \$75.00/Overtime	
12. General Labor	\$12.57/Hour \$51.48/Overtime	\$59.00/Hour \$88.50/Overtime	\$32.50/Per Hour \$48.75/Overtime	\$32.50/Per Hour \$48.75/Overtime	\$32.50/Hour \$48.75/Overtime	

BIDDERS:	AfterDisaster 2606 Phoenix Drive Bldg. 7 Greensboro, NC 27406 Telephone: 800-948-0242 Fax: 336-855-1144	Belfor USA Group, Inc. 185 Oakland Avenue Suite 150 Birmingham, MI 48009 Telephone: 248-594-1144 Fax: 248-594-0464	ServiceMaster Recovery Management 8301 Fortson Road Fortson, Georgia 31808 Telephone: 404-989-4779 Fax: None	American Property Restoration, Inc. 3440 Oakcliff Road Suite 124 Atlanta, Georgia 30340 Telephone: 770-733-3584 Fax: 678-387-2075	Harvin Holdings, LLC d/b/a SERVPRO of Savannah 4131 Ogeechee Road Suite 104 Savannah, Georgia 31405 Telephone: 912-234-9690 Fax: 912-234-13	Land and Cattle, LLC No Bid
ENVIRONMENTAL CLEANUP PER SQ. FT.						
13. Removal and Disposal of Environmental/Biological Waste	\$135.00/Per Sq Ft.	No Bid	Varies Based on type of Waste/Location	\$6.50/Per Sq Ft.	\$70.00/4.25 Per Sq Ft. Box	
EQUIPMENT RENTAL PER DAY: DISASTER RESTORATION						
14. Dehumidifier – LGR	\$108.61/Per Day	\$150.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	\$120.0/Per Day	\$71.00/Per Day	
15. High Speed 500 CFM Air Mover	\$25.11/Per Day	\$33.00/Per Day	\$26.00/Per Day	\$75.00/Per Day	\$28.00/Per Day	
16. Air Scrubber – 1000/2000 CFM	\$123.43/Per Day	\$156.00/Per Day	\$450.00/Per Day	\$120.00/Per Day	\$107.00/Per Day – 1000 CFM \$140.00/Per Day – 2000 CFM	
17. Wet/Dry Hepa Vacuum	\$24.69/Per Day	\$69.00/Per Day	\$30.00/Per Day	\$63.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	
18. Back Pack Hepa Vacuum	\$24.69/Per Day	\$69.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	\$25.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	
19. Dry Force Injectidry (Wall Cavity)	\$124.65/Per Day	\$144.00/Per Day	\$140.00/Per Day	\$124.00/Per Day	\$130.00/Per Day	
20. Activated Oxygen Generator (Ozone)	\$108.61/Per Day	\$137.00/Per Day	\$200.00/Per Day	\$120.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	
21. Truck Mount (Water Extractor)	\$370.28/Per Day	\$618.00/Per Day	\$59.00/Per Day	\$55.00/Per Hour \$440.00/Per Day	\$202.40/Per Day	
22. Portable Wet Clean/Extractor	\$123.43/Per Day	\$171.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	\$20.00/Per Hour \$160.00/Per Day	\$148.00/Per Day	
23. Portable Wet Clean/Extractor	\$123.43/Per Day	\$171.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	\$10.00/Per Hour \$80.00/Per Day	\$148.00/Per Day	
24. Pressure Washer	\$131.00/Per Day	\$137.00/Per Day	\$75.00/Per Day Electric/Cold Water	\$15.00/Per Hour \$120.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	
25. Upright Vacuum	\$24.69/Per Day	\$38.00/Per Day	\$15.00/per Day	\$15.00/Per Hour \$120.00/Per Day	\$26.25/Per Day	
26. Utility Van	\$83.93/Per Day	\$124.00/Per Day	\$115.00/Per Day	\$85.00/Per Day	\$125.00/Per Day	
27. Box Van	\$123.43/Per Day	\$171.00/Per Day	\$175.00/Per Day	\$120.00/Per Day	\$175.00/Per Day	
28. Large Dessicant Dehumidifiers: 1000 SCFM	\$1,234.26/Per Day	\$627.00/Per Day	\$500.00/Per Day	\$450.00/Per Day	\$575.00/Per Day	
29. Large Dessicant Dehumidifiers: 5000 SCFM	\$1,639.09/Per Day	\$1,497.00/Per Day	\$1,400.00/Per Day	\$1,200.00/Per Day	\$1,475.00/Per Day	

BIDDERS:	AfterDisaster 2606 Phoenix Drive Bldg. 7 Greensboro, NC 27406 Telephone: 800-948-0242 Fax: 336-855-1144	Belfor USA Group, Inc. 185 Oakland Avenue Suite 150 Birmingham, MI 48009 Telephone: 248-594-1144 Fax: 248-594-0464	ServiceMaster Recovery Management 8301 Fortson Road Fortson, Georgia 31808 Telephone: 404-989-4779 Fax: None	American Property Restoration, Inc. 3440 Oakcliff Road Suite 124 Atlanta, Georgia 30340 Telephone: 770-733-3584 Fax: 678-387-2075	Harvin Holdings, LLC d/b/a SERVPRO of Savannah 4131 Ogeechee Road Suite 104 Savannah, Georgia 31405 Telephone: 912-234-9690 Fax: 912-234-13	Land and Cattle, LLC No Bid
30. Large Dessicant Dehumidifiers: 15000 SCFM	\$3,200.00/Per Day	\$4,036.00/Per Day	\$3,400.00/Per Day	\$3,500.00/Per Day	\$3,900.00/Per Day	
31. Generator 30KW and up	\$296.22/Per Day	\$130.00/Per Day	\$462.00/Per Day	\$700.00/Per Day	\$365.00/Per Day 20KW \$725.00/Per Day 50KW	
TOTAL	\$8,787.46	\$9,466.00	\$8,452.00	\$8,444.33	\$8,920.90	
What is your normal Response Time?	2 Hours	1-2 hours or less	60 minutes	45-90 minutes	Respond 1 hour Onsite within 2 hours	
What is your emergency Response Time?	2 Hours	1-2 hours or less	60 minutes	60 minutes	Respond 1 hour Onsite within 2 hours	
Is firm accessible evenings, weekends and holidays if needed?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Sabrina L. Scales, CPPB, Director *Sabrina L. Scales* CERTIFIED BY: Kathleen Watson-Scott, CPPB, Purchasing Agent *Kathleen W. Scott*

NUMBER OF ITBs Issued by District 12 TO LMWBE A W 1 H S I L N 1 M
NUMBER NOTIFIED BY GPR: 391 TO LMWBE A 93 AA 6 NA 7 H 14 P/A 1 M 270 NC
NUMBER OF ITBS RECEIVED: 5 FROM LMWBE: A 1 W 1 H S I L 1 N 1 M

KEY: DISTRICT MINORITY DESIGNATIONS:
A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W=WOMAN, H=HISPANIC, S=ASIAN AMERICAN, I=AMERICAN INDIAN, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL, M=MAJORITY
KEY: GPR MINORITY DESIGNATIONS:
A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, AA=ASIAN AMERICAN, NA=NATIVE AMERICAN, H=HISPANIC/LATINO, P/A= PACIFIC ISLAND/AMERICAN, M =NON-MINORITY, NC=NOT CLASSIFIED