

SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
 BID TABULATION
 Bid C16-32

DERENNE MIDDLE SCHOOL AIR COOLED CHILLER REPLACEMENT

CLOSING DATE & TIME: February 9, 2016 @ 11:00 A.M.

PRE-BID: January 26, 2016 @ 10:00 AM

Note: 1 addendum issued against this project.

Bidder:	Doc Signed Y/N	Addendum Acknowledged Y/N	L/MWBE Status	TOTAL BID	Brand/ Model	Standard Warranty Period (Months)	Extended Warranty Offered (Months)	Extended Warranty Cost (Year)
1. Daikin Applied Americas, Inc. DBA Daikin Applied 109 B Owens Industrial Drive Savannah, GA 31405 Phone: 912-443-1888 Fax: 912-443-1989	Yes	Yes	Local	\$108,556.00	Daikin AGZ170E	12 Month Parts & Labor 60 Months Compressor Only	48 Months	N/A
2. Superior Maintenance & Piping Inc. P.O. Box 3752 Aiken, SC 29802 Phone: 803-663-7286 Fax: 803-663-7290	Yes	Yes	Non-Local	\$96,143.00 Alternate Units Proposed	Carrier 30RB170	12 Months	24-60 Months; Parts Only	\$7,216.00
3. After Hours Heating & Air 1355 Whitfield Park Drive Savannah, GA 31406 Phone: 912-691-0670 Email: r.s.holland62@gmail.com	Yes	Yes	Local	\$96,120.00	Daikin AGZ170	12 Months	60 Months Compressors	N/A
4. Erickson Associates, Inc. 1 Erickson Drive Savannah, GA 31405 Phone: 912-527-9500 Fax: 912-527-9510	Yes	Yes	Local	\$78,300.00	Daikin AGZ170E	12 Months Unit 60 Months Compressor	60 Months	\$1,300.00 Parts, Labor and Refrigerant
5. Boaen Mechanical 1223 Mills B. Lane Savannah, GA 31405 Phone: 912-233-3208 Fax: 912-233-3486	Yes	Yes	Local	\$98,230.00	Carrier 30RBX170	12 Months Parts and Labor; 60 Months Compressor	60 Months all parts	\$280.00/Year Parts Only- No Labor
6. Air Management Systems, Inc 292 SE Park Ave Baxley, GA 31513 Phone: 912-366-8585 Fax: 912-366-8584	Yes	Yes	Non-Local	\$109,690.00	Carrier	12 Months Labor; 5 Years Compressor Parts	N/A	N/A
7. Mock Plumbing & Mechanical, Inc. 67 Ross Road Savannah, GA 31405 Phone: 912-232-1104 Fax: 912-232-6284	Yes	Yes	Local	\$97,000.00	Carrier 30RB	12 Months	48 Months-Compressor only after 1 st year	\$3,500.00

8. Milton J. Wood Company 2786 Highway 80 West Garden City, GA 31408 Phone: 912-964-2155 Fax: 912-964-2158	Yes	Yes	Local, Majority	\$110,893.00	Carrier 30RBX170	12 Months	60 Months- Compressor	\$0.00
9. H.A. Sack Co., Inc. 49 Park of Commerce Way, Suite 204 Savannah, GA 31405 Phone: 912-495-6527 Fax: 912-681-4517	Yes	Yes	Local	\$109,656.00	Daikin AGZ140- 180E	12 Months	60 Months- Compressor only	\$393.00
10. Southeastern Air Conditioning Co., Inc. 5515 Export Blvd. Garden City, GA 31408 Phone: 912-964-0220 Fax: 912-966-2340	Yes	Yes	Local	\$91,800.00	Carrier 30RBX170-6	12 Months 60 Months- Compressor only	0	\$0.00
11. American Hermetics	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bidder:	Annual Service Agreement Cost (Year)	Equipment Delivery (Days)	Project Completion (Days)	Required Forms/Documents
1. Daikin Applied Americas, Inc.	\$2,937.00	45 Days ARO	55 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
2. Superior Maintenance & Piping Inc.	\$1,800.00	49 Days ARO	53 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
3. After Hours Heating & Air	\$1,500.00	55 Days ARO	5 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
4. Erickson Associates, Inc.	\$1,250.00	10 Days ARO	20 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
5. Boaen Mechanical	\$1,628.00	42 Days ARO	46 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
6. Air Management Systems, Inc	\$1,000.00 Maintenance only	60 Days ARO	90 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
7. Mock Plumbing & Mechanical, Inc.	\$1,600.00	50 Days ARO	7 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
8. Milton J. Wood Company	\$500.00	60 Days ARO	74 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
9. H.A. Sack Co., Inc.	\$4,500.00	49 Days ARO	60 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
10. Southeastern Air Conditioning Co., Inc.	\$0.00	50 Days ARO	55 Days ARO	Original + One (1) Copy
11. American Hermetics	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Margaret Disher, CPPB, Purchasing Agent CERTIFIED BY: Paige Kriewall, Purchasing Agent *Paige Kriewall*

NUMBER OF BIDS ISSUED: 46 TO LMWBE: A W H M L N
NUMBER OF BIDS FROM LMWBE: 11 FROM LMWBE: A W H M 1 L 8 N 2
RECEIVED:

KEY TO MINORITY DEISGNATIONS: A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W= WOMAN, H= HISPANIC, M=MAJORITY, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL